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We are mindful that a garden is 
sometimes for family and friends 
but then should offer a space to 
seek solace, be emotive or 
generate ideas. It shouldn't have 
that one core theme and offer 
nowhere else to go. We manage 
that by the way the hard 
landscaping, planting and the 
general form work together

We strive to create landscapes 
and outdoor spaces that offer the 
client a layered experience, 
areas with emotional depth 
grown from the ideas behind their 
design. We are always looking to 
forge connections between the 
available space and people, 
bringing a technical approach 
whilst understanding the site and 
the client. Creating a colligation of 
the simple, the complex, the 
contemporary and the old whilst 
at times being bold, then at 
others treading very carefully. 
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Harwood Construction & Landscaping

16 Upper Woburn Place
London
WC1H 0BS

0203 741 8232
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